2019 Road Resurfacing - Bid Results
Muskingum County, Ohio
Bid Opening - May 30, 2019, 10:30am

Project 2019-A1 (448 Asphalt)
Jackson Rd, Mollies Rock Rd, S. Pleasant Grove Rd, Sonora Rd

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Item Descrip. Qty  Shelly & Sands Shelly & Sands  Shelly Co Shelly Co NLS Paving NLS Paving
Tons 448 T1 7,050 | § 77.50 | $ 546,375.00 | $ 76.65| $ 540,382.50 [ $ 72.00 | $507,600.00
Tons 448 Intermediate T2 1,099 [ $ 7750 $ 8517250|% 67.75|$% 74,45725(% 72.00]|$ 79,128.00
Gals 407 tack coat 2,054 | § 200($ 4,108.00]|$% 1.85]|% 3,799.90|% 2.00|$ 4,108.00
Total Bid $ 635,655.50 $ 618,639.65 $590,836.00
Project 2019-A2 (448 Asphalt)
Military Rd, N. Linden Ave, N. River Rd West, Vista View Dr

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Item Descrip. Qty  Shelly & Sands Shelly & Sands  Shelly Co Shelly Co NLS Paving NLS Paving
Tons 448 T1 7,643 | $ 82.50 | $ 630,547.50 | $ 77.25| % 590,421.75| % 75.00 | $573,225.00
Gals 407 tack coat 7,562 | § 205($% 15502.10|$ 1.85]|$% 13,989.70|$ 1.70[$ 12,855.40
Total Bid $ 646,049.60 $ 604,411.45 $586,080.40
Project 2019-A3 (448 Asphalt)
Village of South Zanesville: various streets

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Item Descrip. Qty  Shelly & Sands Shelly & Sands  Shelly Co Shelly Co  NLS Paving NLS Paving
Tons 448 T1 1,971 [ § 84.50 | $ 166,549.50 | $ 88.00 | $ 173,448.00 [ $ 82.00 | $161,622.00
Gals 407 tack coat 1,686 | $ 200($% 3,37200|$% 185]|% 3,119.10|$% 1.70|$ 2,866.20
Total Bid $ 169,921.50 $ 176,567.10 $164,488.20
Project 2019-A4 (448 Asphalt)
Ransbottom Rd and Rose Hill Rd

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Item Descrip. Qty  Shelly & Sands Shelly & Sands  Shelly Co Shelly Co NLS Paving NLS Paving
Tons 448 T1 4,325 $ 86.50 | $ 374,112.50 | $ 74.50 | $ 322,212.50 [ $ 101.50 | $438,987.50
Gals 407 tack coat 4,943 | $ 200)|$ 9,886.00|$ 185|% 9,14455|% 2.00]|$ 9,886.00
Total Bid $ 383,998.50 $ 331,357.05 $448,873.50
Project 2019-MP1 - Motorpave (Coldmix)
Bagley Rd

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Item Descrip. Qty  Shelly & Sands Shelly & Sands  Shelly Co Shelly Co NLS Paving NLS Paving
Tons #57 Agg 3,255 | No Bid No Bid $ 38.00 [ $ 123,690.00 | No Bid No Bid
Gals Coldmix 29,296 | No Bid No Bid $ 3.15[$% 92,282.40 | No Bid No Bid
Tons #9 Agg 289 | No Bid No Bid $ 26.00|% 7,514.00 | No Bid No Bid
Tons #8 Agg 603 | No Bid No Bid $ 29.00|$ 17,487.00 | No Bid No Bid
Gals Seal 21,701 | No Bid No Bid $ 3.13|$% 67,924.13 | No Bid No Bid
Total Bid $ 308,897.53
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2019 Road Resurfacing - Bid Results
Muskingum County, Ohio
Bid Opening - May 30, 2019, 10:30am

Project 2019-MP2 - Motorpave (Coldmix)

Lockman Ln, Cass Twp

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Item Descrip. Qty  Shelly & Sands Shelly & Sands  Shelly Co Shelly Co NLS Paving NLS Paving
Tons #57 Agg 380 | No Bid No Bid $ 45.00[$ 17,100.00 | No Bid No Bid
Gals Coldmix 3,421 | No Bid No Bid $ 325|% 11,118.25 | No Bid No Bid
Tons #9 Agg 34 | No Bid No Bid $ 26.00( 9% 884.00 | No Bid No Bid
Tons #8 Agg 70 | No Bid No Bid $ 32.00|$% 2,240.00 | No Bid No Bid
Gals Seal 2,534 | No Bid No Bid $ 335[% 8,488.90 | No Bid No Bid
Total Bid $ 39,831.15
Project 2019-MP3 - Motorpave (Coldmix)
Miles Run Rd, Cass Twp
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Item Descrip. Qty  Shelly & Sands Shelly & Sands  Shelly Co Shelly Co  NLS Paving NLS Paving
Tons #57 Agg 150 | No Bid No Bid $ 45.00[$% 6,750.00 | No Bid No Bid
Gals Coldmix 1,354 | No Bid No Bid $ 3.25[% 4,400.50 | No Bid No Bid
Tons #9 Agg 13 | No Bid No Bid $ 26.00($% 338.00 | No Bid No Bid
Tons #8 Agg 28 | No Bid No Bid $ 32.00(% 896.00 | No Bid No Bid
Gals Seal 1,003 | No Bid No Bid $ 3.35[% 3,360.05| No Bid No Bid
Total Bid $ 15,744.55
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