
DESCRIPTION OF 87.267 ACRES 
REVISED 9-16-00 

Situated in the State of Ohio, County of Muskingum, Township of Hopewell, being in Lot No. 9 of the 
Third Quarter, Range 9 West, Township 1 North, of "The United States Military District", and being 
bounded and described as follows: 

Beginning at a point in the centerline of Township Road No. 415 (North Hopewell Road) at the southwest 
comer of Lot No. 9 (Note: Reference bearing on the south line of Lot No. 9 used as North 88°04'40" 
West.); 

Thence, from said Point of Beginning and running with the west line of Lot No. 9, the east line of a 
139.82 acres tract as conveyed to Kenneth R. and Gloria J. Osborn by Deed Volume I 050, Page 476, the 
east line of a 0.898 acre tract (First Parcel) and 0.858 acre tract (Second Parcel) as conveyed to Lena Eva 
Grimes and Myrna J. Sidle by Official Records Volume 1500, Page 928, the east line of a 1.125 acres 
tract as conveyed to Roy E. and Rita M. Carpenter by Deed Volume 809, Pages 156 and 157, and the east 
line of a 0.797 acre tract as conveyed to Roy E. and Rita M. Carpenter by Deed Volume 1158, Pages 394, 
of the Muskingum County Recorder's Office, North 01°58'17" East a distance of 1,528.88 feet to an iron 
pin set at the northwest comer of Lot No. 9, being located South 87°26'16" East a distance of 8.46 feet 
from a point in the centerline of Township Road No. 415; 

Thence, with the north line of Lot No. 9, the south line of a 30 acres tract as conveyed to Carroll W. 
Swank, was by the Second Parcel of Deed Volume 569, Page 824 and the south line of a 70.00 acres tract 
as conveyed to Terry A. and Barbara M. Blackstone by Deed Volume 651, Page 182 of the Muskingum 
County Recorder's Office, South 87°26'16" East a distance of2,670.66 feet to a 5/8" iron pin found 
capped "Linn 7113" at the northeast corner of Lot No. 9, passing over the centerline of County Road No. 
8 (Flint Ridge Road) at a distance of plus 1,786.24 feet and passing through two iron pins set at distances 
of plus 1,764.89 feet and plus 1,816.24 feet, respectively; 

Thence, with the east line of Lot No. 9 and the west line ofa 40.26 acres tract as conveyed to Malynda K. 
Franks by Parcel Two of Deed Volume 1153, Page 787 of the Muskingum County Recorder's Office, 
South 02°23'15" West a distance of 818.34 feet to a 5/8" iron pin found capped "Linn 7113", passing 
over the centerline of an existing driveway and easement at a distance of plus 209. 46 feet and passing 
through four iron pins set at distance of plus 179.46 feet, plus 239.46 feet, plus 439.46 feet, and plus 
686. 70 feet, respectively; 

Thence, continuing with the east line of Lot No. 9 and the west line of a 50.00 acres tract as conveyed to 
William J. Hill by Parcel One of Deed Volume 1123, Page 344 of the Muskingum County Recorder's 
Office, South 02°52'50" West a distance of 680.82 feet to an axle found at the southeast comer of 
Lot No. 9, passing through two iron pins set at distance of plus 250.00 feet and plus 472.36 feet, 
respectively; 

Thence, with the south line of Lot No. 9, the north line of a 3.80 acres tract as conveyed to William J. Hill 
by Parcel Three of Deed Volume 1123, Page 344, the north line ofa 35.49 acres tract as conveyed to 
George W. and Jane Murphy by the Second Parcel of Deed Volume 1110, Pages 488 and 490, and the 
north line of a 59.00 acres portion of a 195.44 acres tract as conveyed to Deborah J. and James R. Cooper 
by Deed Volume 1089, Page 247 of the Muskingum County Recorder's Office, North 88°04'40" West a 
distance of2,653.78 feet to The Point of Beginning, passing through a 5/8" iron pin found capped 
"Harkness 7760" at a distance of plus 358.89 feet, passing over the centerline of County Road No. 8 (Flint 
Ridge Road) at a distance of plus 3 79 .14 feet, and passing through two iron pins set at distances of plus 
409.14 feet and plus 2,623.78 feet, respectively; 

Containing 92.583 acres, more or less. 

Subject to all. legal right-of-ways, easement, restrictions, reservations, and zoning regulations of record. 
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Subject to the right-of-way of County Road No. 8. 

Subject to the right-of-way of Township Road No. 415. 

Subject to the 100-Year Flood Plain restrictions, if applicable. 

All iron pins set are 5/8'' x 30" rebar capped and labeled "Claus 6456". 

The bearings in this description are for angle calculations only and are based on the south line of Lot No. 
9 used as an assumed bearing ofNorth 88°04'40" West. 

SUBJECT TO a 16'. 00 feet wide easement or right-of-way for ingress and egress as conveyed to 
Malynda K. Franks by Parcel Two of Deed Volume 1153, Page 787 of the Muskingum County 
Recorder's Office, and being resurveyed and described as follows: 

Commencing for Reference at an axle found at the southeast comer of Lot No. 9 (Note: Reference bearing 
on the south line of Lot No. 9 used as North 88°04'40" West.); 

Thence, with the east line of Lot No. 9, the following two courses: 

(1) North 02°52'50" East a distance of680.82 feet to a 5/8" iron pin found capped "Linn 7113" at a 
northwest comer of a 50.00 acres tract as conveyed to William J. Hill by Parcel One of Deed Volume 

~ 1123, Page 344 of the Muskingum County Recorder's Office, 

(2) Thence North 02°23'15" East a distance of 608.88 feet to a point in the centerline of an existing 
driveway, being THE TRUE POINT OF BEGINNING for this centerline right-of-way description; 

Thence, from said Point of Beginning and running with the centerline of said existing driveway, the 
following five courses: 

(I) North 70°1 l '37" West a distance of29.84 feet to a point; 

(2) Thence South 86°19'35" West a distance of 41.83 feet to a point; 

(3) Thence South 60°28'28" West a distance of 55.94 feet to a point; 

(4) Thence South 35°37'30" West a distance of 140.72 feet to a point; 

(5) Thence South 32°45'59" West a distance of 707.36 feet to a point in the centerline intersection with 
County Road No. 8 (Flint Ridge Road), being The True Point of Beginning for this centerline right-of­
way description; 

Containing 0.358 acres, more or less, of easement or right-of-way. 

Subject· to all legal right-of-ways, easement, restrictions, reservations, and zoning regulations of record. 

Subject to the right-of-way of County Road No. 8. 

EXCEPTING THEREFROM a 5.316 acres tract being reserved by the Grantor and being bounded and 
described as follows: 

Situated in the State of Ohio, County of Muskingum, Township of Hopewell, being in Lot No. 9 of the 
Third Quarter, Range 9 West, Township 1 North, of "The United States Military District", and being 
bounded and described as follows: 
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Commencing for Reference at a point in the centerline of Township Road No. 415 (North Hopewell 
Road) at the southwest corner of Lot No. 9 (Note: Reference bearing on the south line of Lot No. 9 used 
as North 88°04'40" West.); 

Thence, with the south 1ine of Lot No. 9, South 88°04'40" East a distance of 1,102.19 feet to a point; 

Thence, leaving the Lot line, North 01°58'17" East a distance of 460.00 feet to an iron pin set, being THE 
TRUE POINT OF BEGINNING for this description; 

Thence, from said Point of Beginning and continuing, North O 1 °58' 17" East a distance of 185. 00 feet to 
an iron pin set; 

Thence North 78°36' 12" East a distance of 827.66 feet to a point in the centerline of County Road No. 8 
(Flint Ridge Road), passing through two iron pins set at distances of plus 713.99 feet and plus 798.99 feet, 
respective I y; 

Thence, with the centerline of County Road No. 8, the following three courses: 

(1) South 27°25'39" East a distance of 64.94 feet to a point; 

(2) Thence South 34°27'49" East a distance of 134.11 feet to a point; 

(3) Thence South 33°23' 19" East a distance of 51. 78 feet to a point; 

Thence, leaving the road, South 70°10'48" West a distance of240.78 feet to an iron pin set, passing 
through two iron pins set at distances of plus 18. 7 4 feet and plus 103. 7 4 feet, respective I y; 

Thence South 73°14'29" West a distance of 314.26 to an iron pin set; 

Thence North 85°15;04'' West a distance of 426.05 feet to The Point of Beginning; 

Containing 5.316 acres, more or less . 
.. 
I 

Subject to all 1ega1 right-of-ways, easement, restrictions, reservations, and zoning regulations of record. 

Subject to the right-of-way of County Road No. 8. 

Subject to the 100-Year Flood Plain restrictions, if applicable. 

All iron pins set are 5/8" x 30" rebar capped and labeled "Claus 6456" . 

.. 
The bearings in this description are for angle calculations only and are based on the south line of Lot No. 
9 used as an assumed bearing of North 88°04'40" West. 

------------------ ----
After deducting the above described 5.316 acres from the original 92.583 acres, leaving a residue of 
87.267 acres, more or less, being herein conveyed .. 

A plat of the above-described survey has been submitted for file at the County Engineer's Office. 
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7 
DESCRIPTION OF 92.583 ACRES 

Situated in the State of Ohio, County of Muskingum, Township of Hopewell, being in Lot No. 9 of the 
Third Quarter, Range 9 West, Township 1 North, of "The United States Military District", and being 
bounded and described as follows: 

Beginning at a point in the centerline of Township Road No. 415 (North Hopewell Road) at the southwest 
comer of Lot No. 9 (Note: Reference bearing on the south line of Lot No. 9 used as North 88°04'40" 
West.); 

Thence, from said Point of Beginning and running with the west line of Lot No. 9, the east line of a 
139.82 acres tract as conveyed to Kenneth R. and Gloria J. Osborn by Deed Volume 1050, Page 476, the 
east line of a 0.898 acre tract (First Parcel) and 0.858 acre tract (Second Parcel) as conveyed to Lena Eva 
Grimes and Myrna J. Sidle by Official Records Volume 1500, Page 928, the east line of a 1.125 acres 
tract as conveyed to Roy E. and Rita M. Carpenter by Deed Volume 809, Pages 156 and 157, and the east 
line of a 0.797 acre tract as conveyed to Roy E. and Rita M. Carpenter by Deed Volume 1158, Pages 394, 
of the Muskingum County Recorder's Office, North 01°58'17" East a distance of 1,528.88 feet to an iron 
pin set at the northwest comer of Lot No. 9, being located South 87°26'16" East a distance of 8.46 feet 
from a point in the centerline of Township Road No. 415; 

Thence, with the north line of Lot No. 9, the south line of a 30 acres tract as conveyed to Carroll W. 
Swank, was by the Second Parcel of Deed Volume 569, Page 824 and the south line of a 70.00 acres tract 
as conveyed to Terry A. and Barbara M. Blackstone by Deed Volume 651, Page 182 of the Muskingum 
County Recorder's Office, South 87°26'16" East a distance of2,670.66 feet to a 5/8" iron pin found 
capped "Linn 7113" at the northeast comer of Lot No. 9, passing over the centerline of County Road No. 
8 (Flint Ridge Road) at a distance of plus 1,786.24 feet and passing through two iron pins set at distances 
of plus 1,764.89 feet and plus 1,816.24 feet, respectively; 

Thence, with the east line of Lot No. 9 and the west line of a 40.26 acres tract as conveyed to Malynda K. 
Franks by Parcel Two of Deed Volume 1153, Page 787 of the Muskingum County Recorder's Office, 
South 02°23'15" West a distance of818.34 feet to a 5/8" iron pin found capped "Linn 7113", passing 
over the centerline of an existing driveway and easement at a distance of plus 209. 46 feet and passing 
through four iron pins set at distance of plus 179.46 feet, plus 239.46 feet, plus 439.46 feet, and plus 
686. 70 feet, respectively; 

Thence, continuing with the east line of Lot No. 9 and the west line of a 50.00 acres tract as conveyed to 
William J. Hill by Parcel One of Deed Volume 1123, Page 344 of the Muskingum County Recorder's 
Office, South 02°52'50" West a distance of 680.82 feet to an axle found at the southeast comer of 
Lot No. 9, passing through two iron pins set at distance of plus 250.00 feet and plus 472.36 feet, 
respectively; 

Thence, with the south line of Lot No. 9, the north line of a 3.80 acres tract as conveyed to William J. Hill 
by Parcel Three of Deed Volume 1123, Page 344, the north line of a 35.49 acres tract as conveyed to 
George W. and Jane Murphy by the Second Parcel of Deed Volume 1110, Pages 488 and 490, and the 
north line of a 59.00 acres portion of a 195.44 acres tract as conveyed to Deborah J. and James R. Cooper 
by Deed Volume 1089, Page 247 of the Muskingum County Recorder's Office, North 88°04'40" West a 
distance of 2,653.78 feet to The Point of Beginning, passing through a 5/8" iron pin found capped 
"Harkness 7760" at a distance of plus 358.89 feet, passing over the centerline of County Road No. 8 (Flint 
Ridge Road) at a distance of plus 379.14 feet, and passing through two iron pins set at distances of plus 
409. 14 feet and plus 2,623. 78 feet, respectively; 

Containing 92.583 acres, more or less. 

Subject to all legal right-of-ways, easement, restrictions, reservations, and zoning regulations of record. 
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Subject to the right-of-way of County Road No. 8. 

Subject to the right-of-way of Township Road No. 415. 

Subject to the 100-Y ear Flood Plain restrictions, if applicable. 

SUBJECT TO a 16.00 feet wide easement or right-of-way for ingress and egress as conveyed to 
Malynda K. Franks by Parcel Two of Deed Volume 1153, Page 787 of the Muskingum County 
Recorder's Office, and being resurveyed and described as follows: 

Commencing for Reference at an axle found at the southeast comer of Lot No. 9 (Note: Reference bearing 
on the south line of Lot No. 9 used as North 88°04 '40" West.); 

Thence, with the east line of Lot No. 9, the following two courses: 

(1) North 02°52'50" East a distance of 680.82 feet to a 5/8" iron pin found capped ''Linn 7113" at a 
northwest corner of a 50.00 acres tract as conveyed to William J. Hill by Parcel One of Deed Volume 
1123, Page 344 of the Muskingum County Recorder's Office, 

(2) Thence North 02°23'15" East a distance of 608.88 feet to a point in the centerline of an existing 
driveway, being THE TRUE POINT OF BEGINNING for this centerline right-of-way description; 

Thence, from said Point of Beginning and running with the centerline of said existing driveway, the 
following five courses: 

(I) North 70°11 '37" West a distance of29.84 feet to a point; 

(2) Thence South 86°19'35" West a distance of 41.83 feet to a point; 

(3) Thence South 60°28'28" West a distance of 55.94 feet to a point; 

(4) Thence South 35°37'30" West a distance of 140. 72 feet to a point; 

(5) Thence South 32°45'59" West a distance of707.36 feet to a point in the centerline intersection with 
County Road No. 8 (Flint Ridge Road), being The True Point of ll ,in• iaig for this centerline right-of-
way description; E I>/ II<. 

~ontaining 0.358 acres, more or less, of easement or right-of-way. 

Subject to all legal right-of-ways, easement, restrictions, reservations, and zoning regulations of record. 

Subject to the right-of-way of County Road No. 8. 

Subject to the 100-Y ear Flood Plain restrictions, if applicable. 

All iron pins set are 5/8" x 30" rebar capped and labeled "Claus 6456". 

The bearings in this description are for angle calculations only and are based on the south line of Lot No. 
9 used as an assumed bearing ofNorth 88°04'40" West. 

A plat of the above-described survey has been submitted for file at the County Engineer's Office. 
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Description of92.583 acres. 

The above description prepared by Roger W. Claus, Registered Surveyor No. 6456, based on an actual 
field survey of September 7, 2000~ said survey being subject to any facts that may be disclosed in a full 
and accurate title search. 

Date: 
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