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DESCRIPTION FOR CONVEYANCE 
Premises at 2 343 East Pike, Zanesville, Ohio 

OW11ers: DUVALL, Michael and Debra 

'23<,,,{t, V.c;,7 ?1><.f;_

Situated in the 3rd Quarter of Township 1, Range 7, United States Military Lands, Washington 
Township, Muskingum County, Ohio, and being further described as follows: 

Commencing at a point marlled by an existing stone at the Southwest corner of Lot Number 3 of 
John C. Howard's Sulxlivision as recorded in Deed Book 9, Page 394, of the Muskingum County 
Deed Records; thence South 02°28'32" East along the East line of said 3rd Quarter a distance of 
1284.91 feet (by deed) to an iron pin on the South Limited Access Right-of-Way Line of 
Interstate 70; thence North 81"03'01" West along said Right-of-Way Line a distance of 210.88 
feet (by deed) to an iron pin; thence South 02 °12'48" East a distance of 327.46 feet (by deed) to 
an existing wood post; thence North 87°31'26" East a distance of 54.00 feet (by deed) lo an 
existing iron pin; thence South 03°04'34" East a distance of 396.46 feet (by deed) to a point in 
the center of U. s. Route 40, thence South 60°55'45" West a distance of 25.32 feet (by deed) 
along said center to a point; thence North 02°31'23" West a distance of 106.45 feet (by deed) to 
an existing iron pin; thence North 65°09'09" West a distance of 125.10 feet (by deed) lo an 
existing iron pin; thence South 82°25'35" West a distance of 179.07 feet to the Place of 
Beginning of the premises helllin intended to be described, said pc>int intended to be lhe 
Northeast comer of Parcel Two in a deed to Michael Edward Duvall and Debra Duvall recorded 
in Deed Book 723, Page 247 of the Public Records of said County: thence along the Easterly line 
thereof South 05"38'09" East a distance of 266.89 feel to a point in the centerline of U S. Roule 
40, passing the Northerly Right-of-way line thereof at 214.88 feet: thence along said centerline in 
a westerly dilllciion on a curve to the right having a radius of 1910.08 feet a distance of 66.00 
feet (chord bears South 69°34'13" West, 66.00 feet) to the Southeast corner of Parcel One ol the 
aforemen1ioned doed to said Duvall; thence con1inuing along said centerline and curve a 
distance of 60.00 feet (chord bears South 71°27'37" West, 60.00 feel) to the Sou1heast corner of 
the premises now or formerly owned by Burl L. Calendine and Camilla Calendine (Deed Book 
553, Page 927); thence North 03°18'55" West along the Easterly line of said Calendine property 
a distance of 320.68 feet to the Northeast corner thereof, passing \he Northerly Right-of-way line 
of U.S. Route 40 at 41.31 feet; thence South 71°14'35" East along the Southerly line of land 
conveyed to Larry H. Huffman and Edna M. Hu/Iman (Deed Book 642, Page 307) a distance of 
60.77 feet to an existing iron pin at the Northwest corner of Parcel Two conveyed to said Duvall; 
thence along the Northerly line thereof North 82°25'35" East a distance of 54.00 feet to the Place 
of Beginning, containing 0.77 acre. 

Bearings based on those found in Deed Book 902, Page 207, Muskingum County Records. 

Being all of Auditors Parcel 71-70-58-01-28-000 rontaining 0.40 acre of which 0.06 aclll lies 
within the Right-of-Way of u. S. Route 40. 
Being all of Auditor's Parcel 71-70-58-01-29-000 con1aining 0.37 aclll of wl1ich O 07 acre lies 
w1!h1n the Right-of-Way of U S Route 40 

This description wn11en by Jerry Lee clJFoGJGEt
��

No 5737, 011 Apnl 1, 1993. 
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